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Current Organization: Knox County March 23, 2017 12:27:54 PMEDT Q @ 7/ € ™

About = ES
Home ltems Documents .
Quick
Vendors Buy Find It JAY GARRISON
Bid Tabulation for Bid #00002508
Quotes Revisions Items Header Questions Subcontractors Routing Attachments Score Summary Back to Bid
Bid Award Validation Warnings
» The following items are not awarded:[1, 2, 3, 4, 5,6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17].
# of Quotes per page: Sort by:| Quote Total V| |Ascending V| Go
Total Item 17 Total Awardable Quote 4 Bid 2BO - Bid Opened (Quotes received and opened. Ready for
Count: Count: Status: tabulation)
0 Please make sure that you save your changes before you navigate to another page.
Cancel Item info/Quote info (14790)GALLS AN (11017)CRAIG'S (74116)SUMMIT (71438)MTCM
ARAMARK COMPANY FIREARM SUPPLY INC UNIFORM SOLUTIONS Enterprises, Inc dba
<Quote: 00008870> <Quote: 00008871> INC. Greene Military, dba Kay
<Quote: 00008858> Uniforms
<Quote: 00008857>
[]  Pants: 511 Stryke, No Bid L1 g54.90 L1 $79.90 L] s72.50
Polyester/Cotton Rip Stop NB ok Discount: 25% Discount: 20%
(Different Colors): Include Discount: 30%. DT DT DT
Manufacture.rlBrand Alternate Description: Alternate Description:
ltem #:1  Print bid as spec. 74369 Sizes 28-44
Sequence:1.0 Status:2BO Add to Original Factory Hem'd(shown)
- Opened Description 74369L Sizes 46-54
Quantity:1.0  Uom:EA Replace Original KCSO Price $73.00
Description Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description
|:| Shirt: Performance Polo No Bid |:| $0.001 |:| $47.99 |:| $45.00
Long Sleeve, 100% NB ok Discount: 25% Discount: 20%
Polyester (Different Colors): Discount: 0% DT DT
Include Manl:lfacturerlBrand Alternate Description: Alternate Description:
ltem #:2  Print bid as spec. 72049 Sizes S-2XL
Sequence:2.0 Status:2BO Add to Original (shown) Size 3XL & Talls
- Opened Description 72049T KCSO Price
Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA Replace Original $45.00
Description Add to Original
Description

https://kepurchase knoxcounty.org/bso/bid/tabulation/items.sdo?docId=00002508
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Shirt: Performance Polo No Bid
Short Sleeve, 100% NB
Polyester (Different Colors):

Include Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:3  Print

Sequence:3.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Boots: 5.11 ATAC, choice of No Bid
6 or 8 inch boot with side NB
zip: Include

Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:4 Print

Sequence:4.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Pants: Fechheimer Brother: No Bid
Include Manufacturer/Brand NB
Item #:5 Print

Sequence:5.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Shirt: Fechheimer Brother No Bid
Command Shirt, Long NB
Sleeve: Include

Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:6 Print

Sequence:6.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Shirt: Fechheimer Brother No Bid
Command Shirt, Short NB
Sleeve: Include

Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:7 Print

Sequence:7.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

L] $0.001
e
Discount: 0%

] $99.99
Discount: 25%
DT

] $0.001
sk
Discount: 0%

] $0.001

EE 3

Discount: 0%

] $0.001

£+
Discount: 0%

[ $42.97
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec.
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[] $100.99
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec. 6 inch side
Zip retail - $94.99 35%
discount bid
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

] $50.00
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec.
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[] $53.80
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec.
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[] $38.20
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec.
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description
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Replace Original
Description

] $40.00
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
71049 Sizes XS-2XL
(shown) 3XL & Talls
71049T KCSO Price
$40.00
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

] s92.50
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
12002 6IN Boot (shown)
12001 ATAC 8INCH
SideZip KCSO Price
$81.00
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

L] s46.88
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Southeastern Code 9
Pants, See Attached,
Dealers of Blauer &
Horace Small
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

] $45.00
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Southeastern Code 9,
Navy or White, Long
Sleeve Shirt, See
Attached, Dealer of
BLauer & Horace Small
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[ ga1.25
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Southeastern Code 9,
Navy or White, Short
Sleeve Shirt, See
Attached, Dealer of
Blauer & Horace Small
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Patch: Tennessee Law
Enforcement Academy,
HerdAf??s Pride: Include
Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:8 Print
Sequence:8.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Tie: S Broome #90063-61,
Clip On: Include
Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:9 Print
Sequence:9.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Tie: S Broome #90111-61,
False Neck with Velcro
Strip: Include
Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:10 Print
Sequence:10.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Jacket: Fechheimer Brother
#78140, Black: Include
Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:11  Print
Sequence:11.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Police Cap: 8-Point, Bayly
#977400: Include
Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:12  Print
Sequence:12.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Shoes: Rocky # 8032,
Insulated Waterproof:
Include Manufacturer/Brand
Item #:13  Print
Sequence:13.0 Status:2BO

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

[ $0.001

A
Discount: 0%

] $0.001
ok
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

] $0.001

sk
Discount: 0%

1 $0.001

o
Discount: 0%

[] $0.001
3
Discount: 0%

[ $3.00
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec.
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[] $5.50
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec.
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

L1 $7.39
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec.
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

] $406.00
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec.
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

] $130.00
Discount: 50%
DT
Alternate Description:
08NO8F3 retail of $130
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

] $104.99
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bidding Rocky 2173.
Spec. model is obsolete
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Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[ s2.19

Discount: 20%
DT

[ $4.50

Discount: 20%
DT

[ s6.88

L4

Discount: 20%, DT

] $375.00
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Alternate Blauer 9820-60
Black TacShell & Liner,
See Attached, Dealers or
5.11 & Horace Small
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[] $55.00
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Navy Cap, Silver Buttons
& Black Hat Strap
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[ $231.25
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
#8032 Discontinued
Alternate Rocky
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- Opened
Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Duty Holster: Gould and No Bid
Goodrich, Model B29: NB
Include Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:14  Print

Sequence:14.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Handcuffs: S&W Chain and No Bid
Hinge, Model 100: Include NB
Manufacturer/Brand

Item #:15 Print

Sequence:15.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Plate Carrier/Active Shooter |:| $422.97
Vest: Include Discount: 24.64%
Manufacturer/Brand DT
Item #:16  Print

Sequence:16.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Armor: Include No Bid
Manufacturer/Brand NB
Item #:17 Print

Sequence:17.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Totals: $Vendor Gross Total: $422.97
$ Vendor Discount: ($104.22)
$ Vendor Net Total: $318.75

$ Preference Discount: $0.00
$ Evaluation Total: $318.75

[ $138.99

EE 3

Discount: 20%, DT

] $37.99
Discount: 20%
DT

[ $256.00

£ 4
Discount: 55%, DT

[ $718.00
Discount: 55%
DT

$1,305.97
($612.59)
$693.36
$0.00
$693.36

Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

] $150.00
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
bidding Safariland 6360
holster
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[]s31.36
£
Discount: 25%, DT
Alternate Description:
bid as spec. Model 300
retail $44.49 discount
25%
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[] $298.98
Discount: 25%
DT
Alternate Description:
CRK E3486-2V 10X12
CRITICAL RESPONSE
KIT by Propper
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[] $399.98
.34
Discount: 25%, DT
Alternate Description:
PLATES (B) F3721-2V
by Propper
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

$1,960.23
($522.56)
$1,437.67

$0.00
$1,437.67
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FQO0081321 All Leather,
Gore-Tex, 400G
Insulated

Add to Original
Description

Replace Original
Description

[ $143.75
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Safariland 6360, as per
Addendum 1, Black
Basketweave
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[ $31.25
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Chained (shown) Hinged
Cost KCSO Price $38
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[ $567.13
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Propper Critical Respone
Kit F3486, See Attached
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

[ $750.00
Discount: 20%
DT
Alternate Description:
Safariland Second
Change 5 CA-MRO1-11
(shown), Safariland
SCA-SM02-11 KCSO
Price $850, Safariland
SCA-MR01-111A KCSO
Price $700
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

$2,550.08
($510.02)
$2,040.05

$0.00
$2,040.05
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$ Vendor Freight: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Eval Codes: NI NI

Pref Codes:

Award/Unaward All: Award All Award All Award All Award All
Unaward All Unaward All Unaward All Unaward All
Evaluation Code Descriptions:
## = Lowest Item Price or Lowest Evaluation Quote Total DT = Discount Only Quote
NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems
Cancel Items | | Save & Continue
Copyright © 2017 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved. default
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